
BID# 16-20 "HOUSEKEEPING SUPPLIES"

FLORENCIE PATTON, PRINCIPAL BUYER

underwoodf@jccal.org

HARRIETT BELL

bellh@jccal.org

GROUP 1:  BROOMS & BROOM HEADS

DESCRIPTION
APPRX 

QTY

UNIT 

PRICE
EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE

BROOM, INDOOR, HOUSEHOLD TYPE 100% CORN FIBER, 

22” BRISTLES, 13” SWEEP FACE, CRYSTAL LAKE#12104, 

LAGASSE #926C, ABCO#10010 OR APPROVED EQUAL

300 $4.30 $1,290.00 NO BID NO BID $15.28 $4,584.00

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

BROOM, STREET, HD ONLY, 16”, EXTRA HVY-DUTY 

BRUSH; BRISTLES: 6 ROW HVY GAUGE POLYPROPYLENE, 

TRIMMED 4 ¼” W/TWO TAPERED HANDLE HOLES. 

WRIGHT BERNET#5805, HARDWOOD LUMBER #1NA16 OR 

APPROVED EQUAL

36 $6.41 $230.76 NO BID NO BID $25.27 $909.72

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

BROOM, FLAGGED, 1” HANDLE, 24”, HOGG #924 OR 

APPROVED EQUAL
224 $8.05 $1,803.20 NO BID NO BID $40.82 $9,143.68

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

BROOM LOBBY, CRYSTAL LAKE# 12223 OR APPROVED 

EQUAL
288 $2.59 $745.92 NO BID NO BID $9.99 $2,877.12

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

PUSH BROOM HD 24” HOG HAIR BRISTLES, TWO THRDED 

HANDLE HOLES (WITHOUT HANDLE) HOGEBRUSH#124 

OR APPROVED EQUAL

48 $8.76 $420.48 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

BROOM HD (ONLY) FOR PUSH BROOM, PALMYRA FIBER 

BRISTLES (STRAW LIKE) 24”, BIRDWELL #75-8422 OR 

APPROVED EQUAL.  NO HANDLE

100 $7.90 $790.00 NO BID NO BID $23.67 $2,367.00

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

WOOD HANDLE TAPERED HANDLE 100 $3.60 $360.00 $3.25 $325.00 $18.15 $1,815.00

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

PUSH BROOM, HANDLE SCREW TIP 60” 100 $2.90 $290.00 $2.50 $250.00 $14.28 $1,428.00

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

BUDGET JANITORIAL SUPPLY

WRIGHT BERNET/WB5855-BRU130216

HOGG# 9254 / BRU100124

CRYSTAL LAKE / 926C-LAFBR0906

CENTRAL PAPER COMPANY CINTAS CORPORATION

CRYSTAL LAKE / 926C-LAFBR0906

BRUT140460 /(METAL TIP 15/16X60)

BRU 140360 (1-1/8X60)

BIRDWELL# 75-8422 / BRU120224

HOGEBRUSH#124/ BRU 100424

RUBBERMAID / FG6362

RUBBERMAID / FG-6361

GENUINE JOE /GJO12002EA

GENUINE JOE / GJO 99653

GENUINE JOE /GJO 30125

RUBBERMAID / 29457

GENUINE JOE / GJO 99652

GENUINE JOE / GJO 60468

ETTORE / ETO 4215

mailto:underwoodf@jccal.org
mailto:bellh@jccal.org


Group 1: TOTAL $44.51 $5,930.36 $5.75 $575.00 $147.46 $23,124.52

GROUP 2:  BRUSHES

DESCRIPTION
APPRX 

QTY

UNIT 

PRICE
EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE

BRUSH: UTILITY/BENCH, 9” WITH HORSE HAIR BRISTLES 

2 ½”, WOOD HANDLE 14” BVERTAIL STYLE, NATURAL 

LACQUERED HARDWOOD, WRIGHT BERNET #2619, HOGE 

#11TA9 OR APPROVED EQUAL

480 $3.70 $1,776.00 NO BID NO BID $22.14 $10,627.20

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

BRUSH (DAIRY/UTILITY TYPE), POLYPROPYLENE FIBER, 

PLASTIC BLOCK, 8 ½ X 3” OVERALL SIZE 9”, ST, NICK #515 

OR APPROVED EQUAL

120 $2.50 $300.00 NO BID NO BID $12.38 $1,485.60

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

CAR WASH BRUSH, 9” LONG W/NYLON BRISTLES, 

CARLISLE #41583, FLO PACK #468       10” LONG OR 

APPROVED EQUAL

132 $8.60 $1,135.20 $10.85 $1,432.20 $12.38 $1,485.00

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

TOILET BRUSH 5-1/2 X 5” PLASTIC 100 $1.25 $125.00 $1.05 $105.00 $4.64 $464.00

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

Group 2: TOTAL $16.05 $3,336.20 $11.90 $1,537.20 $51.54 $14,061.20

DESCRIPTION
APPRX 

QTY

UNIT 

PRICE
EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE

COVERS: DUST MOP FOR 36” FRAME 5” X 36”, YARN 

TYYPE 400 SIZE 3.5 CRYSTAL LAKE OR APPROVED 

EQUAL               

108 $4.61 $497.88 NO BID NO BID 5.42 $765.18

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

DUST MOP: DUST MOP FRAME 5” X 36” 108 $4.60 $496.80 $3.60 $388.80 $2.28 $246.24

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

DUST MOP COVERS FOR 24” FRAME DISPOSALBE 

CRYSTAL LAKE #92412 OR APPROVED EQUAL               
244 $3.25 $793.00 NO BID NO BID $3.95 $963.80

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

DUST MOP: DUST MOP FRAME 5” X 24” 100 $3.74 $374.00 $2.40 $240.00 $2.32 $232.00

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

DUST MOP HANDLE, CLIP ON HANDLE, 15/16X60” 100 $4.98 $498.00 $5.50 $550.00 $4.00 $400.00

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

CINTAS

BRU170660 CINTAS

RUBBERMAID / FG6310BRU 280211

CARLISLE / 468-BRU180210

ST. NICK# 515 /BRU 200208

HOGE#11TA9 / BRU250808

CINTAS

CINTAS

CINTAS

GROUP 3:  COVERS AND FRAMES-DUST MOPS’ & DUSTPANS

CARLISLE / 36120902

RUBBERMAID / FGM253000000

O'DELL /H600

CRYSTAL LAKE / BRU175136

BRU170436

CRYSTAL LAKE / 92412-BRU175124

RUBBERMAID / FGM255000000

BRU170424

GENUINE JOE / GJO 98215

GENUINE JOE / GJO 98215

SKILCRAFT / 7920001788315



PLASTIC MOP HANDLE WITH SCREW DOWN 100 $5.79 $579.00 $5.75 $575.00 $7.00 $700.00

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

DUSTER, OSTRICH FTHER WITH WOODEN HANDLE, 

FTHERS WRAPPED IN PLASTIC PACKAGED IN MOTH 

BALLS, CRYSTAL LAKE #1203 OR APPROVED EQUAL

1970 $4.94 $9,731.80 NO BID NO BID $19.64 $3,869.08

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

LOBBY DUST PAN, PLASTIC, RUBBERMAID#2007, 

CONTINENTAL#812 OR APPROVED EQUAL
168 $7.99 $1,342.32 $7.50 $1,260.00 $8.00 $1,344.00

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

DUST PAN, PLASTIC, HVY DUTY 8.25” X 12.25” X 

13.25”, RUBBERMAID#2005-00, CONTINENTAL# 712 OR 

APPROVED EQUAL

192 $2.39 $458.88 $1.50 $288.00 $15.15 $2,908.80

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

HANDLE, JANITOR MOP HD, WITH SCREW DOWN 

METAL CLAMP
100 $6.35 $635.00 $5.75 $575.00 $24.30 $2,430.00

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

Group 3: TOTAL $32.44 $15,406.68 $26.00 $3,876.80 $78.09 $13,612.86

GROUP 4: MOPS, MOP BUCKETS & MOP HEADS

DESCRIPTION
APPRX 

QTY

UNIT 

PRICE
EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE

FLOOR MOP, 24 OZ., LIGHT DUTY, WOOD HANDLE, 

CRYSTAL LAKE #12707 OR APPROVED EQUAL
288 $5.84 $1,681.92 NO BID NO BID $35.00 $10,080.00

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

MOP HD- LARGE (WEB FOOT FINISH), HD ONLY, 

CRYSTAL LAKE#11562 OR APPROVED EQUAL
36 $4.99 $179.64 NO BID NO BID $11.58 $416.88

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

MOP HD- MEDIUM (WEB FOOT FINISH), HD ONLY, 

CRYSTAL LAKE#11561 OR APPROVED EQUAL
288 $4.55 $1,310.40 NO BID NO BID $10.99 $3,165.12

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

MOP BUCKET & WRINGER, PLASTIC, SIDE 

PRESSURE COMBO, 35 QT. CAPACITY, 

RUBBERMAID#75800-00, WHITE#2635-3/6000 OR 

APPROVED EQUAL

60 $39.99 $2,399.40 $49.00 $2,940.00 $68.99 $4,139.40

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

CRYSTAL LAKE /11562-BRU160224 CINTAS /31062

WHITE# 2635 / 2635-3-153210 GENUNIE JOE/GJO29422

CRYSTAL LAKE / 11561-BRU160218 CINTAS / 31063

CARLISLE 60" HARDWOOD MOP HANDLE

CRYSTAL LAKE /12707-BRU161320 GENUINE JOE/GJO

CONTINENTAIL# 712/BRU410412 GENUINE JOE /GJO

BRU150160 SKILCRAFT /7920002671218

CRYSTAL LAKE/1203-LAM D22EC
IMPACT PRODUCTS ECONOMY DUSTER /IMP 

4603

CONTINENTAL# 812/BRU410112 GENUINE JOE /GJO0246

RUBBERMAID / FGH116000000

RUBBERMAID / FG253100B1A

RUBBERMAID / FG200500CHAR

RUBBERMAID / FGH516000000

BRU150960



BUCKET WITH HANDLE, ROUND, PLASTIC 14-QT. 

CAPACITY, WHITE, RUBBERMAID #2614, 

CONTINENTAL #8114 OR APPROVED EQUAL

36 $6.25 $225.00 $5.60 $201.60 $27.85 $1,002.60

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

MOP HDS, LARGE GREEN (OR OTHER LIGHT 

COLOR) LOOP-END, CRYSTAL LAKE#11570 OR 

APPROVED EQUAL

60 $4.99 $299.40 NO BID NO BID $11.58 $416.80

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

MOP HDS, MEDIUM GREEN (OR OTHER LIGHT 

COLOR) LOOP-END, CRYSTAL LAKE#11569 OR 

APPROVED EQUAL

48 $4.55 $218.40 NO BID NO BID $9.45 $453.60

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

MOP HDS, LARGE, LOOP-END FINISH MOP HD 

(18LBS PER DOZEN), CRYSTAL LAKE#12362 OR 

APPROVED EQUAL

72 $4.99 $359.28 NO BID NO BID $11.58 $833.76

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

Group 4: TOTAL $76.15 $6,673.44 $54.60 $3,141.60 $187.02 $20,508.16

GROUP 5:  PADS-BUFFING AND SCRUBBING

DESCRIPTION
APPRX 

QTY
UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE

BUFFING PAD: 20” BEIGE, 5/BOX, ACS FIBERS #42-20, 

3M PRODUCT OR APPROVED EQUAL
380 $12.50 $4,750.00 $11.00 $4,180.00 $34.41 $13,075.80

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

BUFFING PAD: 20” RED, 5/BOX, ACS FIBERS #51-20, 

3M PRODUCT OR APPROVED EQUAL
180 $2.55 $459.00 $2.20 $396.00 $34.41 $6,193.80

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

BUFFING PAD: 20” WHITE, 5/BOX, ACS FIBERS #41-20, 

3M PRODUCT OR APPROVED EQUAL
422 $12.50 $5,275.00 $11.00 $4,642.00 $34.41 $1,307.80

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

BUFFING PAD: 20” BLACK, 5/BOX, ACS FIBERS #41-20, 

3M PRODUCT OR APPROVED EQUAL
160 $2.55 $408.00 $2.20 $352.00 $34.41 $1,307.80

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

FLOOR PADS, 20” AQUA FLOOR PADS, ACS FIBERS# 

31-20, OR APPROVED EQUAL
360 $2.50 $900.00 $2.20 $792.00 $34.41 $130.80

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

FLOOR PADS, 21” WHITE FLOOR PADS, ACS FIBERS# 

41-21, OR APPROVED EQUAL
78 $16.05 $1,251.90 $2.60 $202.80 NO BID NO BID

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

FLOOR PADS, 13” RED FLOOR PADS, ACS FIBERS# 51-

13, OR APPROVED EQUAL
120 $1.75 $210.00 $1.25 $150.00 $21.91 $3,505.60

MFG NAME & PROD. NO. ACS /ACS PAD 13 RED ACS /51-13 GENUINE JOE/ GJO 90415

ACS / ACS PAD 20 BLA ACS/72-20 GENUNIE JOE / GJO90220

ACS / ACS PAD 21 AQU ACS/31-20 GJO 90620

GENUNIE JOE/GJO90420

ACS / ACS PAD 20 RED ACS / 51-20 GENUINE JOE / GJO 90520

ACS / ACS PAD 20 WHI

CRYSTAL LAKE / 11569-BRU160218 CINTAS 31060

CRYSTAL LAKE / 12362-BRU160824 CINTAS 31067

GENUINE JOE /GJO92220ACS / 41-20

RUBBERMAID/RCP 261400GY

CRYSTAL LAKE / 11570-BRU160224 CINTAS 31062

CONTINENTAL / 8114-BRU153210

ACS /ACS PAD 20BEI ACS /42-20

ACS/ACS PAD 21 WHI ACS /41-21



FLOOR PADS, 13” WHITE FLOOR PADS, ACS FIBERS# 

41-13, OR APPROVED EQUAL
160 $1.75 $280.00 $1.25 $200.00 $21.91 $2,103.36

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

FLOOR PADS, 13” BLACK FLOOR PADS, ACS FIBERS# 

72-13, OR APPROVED EQUAL
96 $1.75 $168.00 $1.25 $120.00 $21.91 $1,796.62

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

FLOOR PADS, 13” BLUE FLOOR PADS, ACS FIBERS# 

53-13, OR APPROVED EQUAL
82 $1.75 $143.50 $1.25 $102.50 $28.05 $3,085.50

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

FLOOR PADS, 15” WHITE FLOOR PADS, ACS FIBERS# 

41-15, OR APPROVED EQUAL
110 $1.75 $192.50 $1.55 $170.50 $0.00

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

FLOOR PADS, 15” BLUE FLOOR PADS, ACS FIBERS# 

53-15, OR APPROVED EQUAL
48 $1.85 $88.80 $1.55 $74.40 NO BID NO BID

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

FLOOR PADS, 15” RED FLOOR PADS, ACS FIBERS# 53-

15, OR APPROVED EQUAL
96 $1.85 $177.60 $1.55 $148.80 $28.05 $2,692.80

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

FLOOR PADS, 27” WHITE, HIGH SPEED NORTON, OR 

APPROVED EQUAL
68 $7.10 $482.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

Group 5: TOTAL $68.20 $14,787.10 $14.45 $11,531.00 $156.24 $22,352.08

GROUP 6:  SPRAYER AND SPRAY BOTTLES

DESCRIPTION
APPRX 

QTY

UNIT 

PRICE
EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE

SPRAY BOTTLE WITH TRIGGER SPRAYER, 32 OZ., 

PLASTIC, HVY DUTY, SPRAYCO#XR2500, 

CONTINENTAL 3333-932CN OR APPROVED EQUAL

250 $1.25 $312.50 NO BID NO BID $2.99 $747.50

MFG NAME & PROD. NO.

Group 6: TOTAL $1.25 $312.50 $0.00 $0.00 $187.28 $747.50

$238.60 $46,446.28 $112.70 $20,661.60 $807.63 $94,406.32

REQUIRED FORMS

ACS / ACS PAD 27 WHI

ACS / 51-15

ACS / ACS PAID 15 BLU ACS / 53-15 CINTAS / 57830

ACS / ACS PAID 15 RED CINTAS / 57830

CONTINENTAL / 333-9332CNBOLSPRA

GENUINE JOE/ GJO 90415

ACS / ACS PAID 15 WHI ACS / 41-15

ACS /ACS PAD 13 WHI ACS / 41-13 GENUINE JOE/ GJO 90415

ACS / ACS PAD 13 BLA ACS / 72-13 GENUINE JOE/ GJO 90415

GRAND TOTAL - GROUP 1 - GROUP 6

ACS / ACS PAD 13 BLU ACS / 53-13

Notification of Intent to Respond YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

Equal Opportunity Certification Form

Affidavit of Contractor

Non-Collusion Affidavit

Statement of Compliance with Alabama Code 31-13-9

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES



CINTAS CORPORATION 5970 Greenwood Pkwy, Bessemer, AL 35022 | Kelsey Simpson p: 205-424-2250 Email: seldonk@cintas.com

CENTRAL PAPER COMPANY INC. 

YES

YES

140 West Oxmoor Rd., Birmingham, AL 35209 | Paul J. Ross P: 205-942-6333 E: pjr@centralpaper-al.com

BUDGET JANITORIAL SUPPLY

Signature Sheet

Price Sheet

Conatact Information

YES

YES

90 Pardue Rd, Pelham, AL 35124| Steven l. Savage P: 205-663-1822 E: ssavage@bjsupply.com

YES

YES


